
[[VLS]] VOLVO EC200EL 314328 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP370475
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: VLS

216 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - PIEDMONT407 OAK ROADPIEDMONT, SCUS  29673Contact: KEMP COBLEkemp.coble@ascendummachinery.comT: (864)704-1060F: (864)704-1069
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The aluminumlevel is severe. The tin level is severe.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Light fueldilution occurring. The oil viscosity islower than normal. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO4596Unique No: 10258628Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Dec 2022
Report Id: VOLVO4596 [WUSCAR] 05719052 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:39:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEMP COBLE - VOLVO4596

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP370475 VCP339263 VCP366372 VCP366366Sample Date 14 Dec 2022 10 Oct 2022 15 Aug 2022 08 Aug 2022Machine Hours 4051 3645 3328 3284Oil Hours 500 500 0 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 12.6 12.8 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.5 7.2 11.1 9.8Oxidation (PA) % 93 99 85 107
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.5 0.4 0.2 0.8Nitration (PA) % 76 65 53 101Sulfation (PA) % 68 70 66 74Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 2.6 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 54 72 28 152Sodium ppm 3 3 2 3Potassium ppm 0 1 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 53 142 17 50Copper ppm 5 7 <1 3Lead ppm 1 <1 <1 2Tin ppm 129 256 80 120Aluminum ppm 78 91 8 53Chromium ppm 9 15 1 5Molybdenum ppm 44 44 39 40Nickel ppm 6 9 <1 2Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1759 1774 1577 1570Magnesium ppm 507 491 443 488Zinc ppm 1177 1186 1059 1078Phosphorus ppm 921 891 890 850Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 27 20 48 18

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4596 [WUSCAR] 05719052 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:39:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEMP COBLE - VOLVO4596
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200EL 314328\Diesel Engine [VCP370475] 14 Dec 2022 @ 4051.0 hrs

