
[[SESI]] TAKEUCHI TL10 201002821 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP384031
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SESI

367 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - BUFORD3779 RYDER BLVDBUFORD, GAUS  30519Contact: Dana Vaccarodana.vaccaro@ascendummachinery.comT: (678)318-9500F: (678)318-9534
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Cylinder,crank, or cam shaft wear is indicated.All other component wear rates arenormal. Elemental levels of silicon (Si)and aluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8529Unique No: 10272161Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Dec 2022
Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 05727580 (Generated: 12/28/2023 14:50:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP384031 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Dec 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2952 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 16.2 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 92 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 1.6 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 113 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 80 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 73 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 9 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 121 --- --- ---Copper ppm 11 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 54 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 7 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 81 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2553 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 206 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1366 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1097 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 55 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 05727580 (Generated: 12/28/2023 14:50:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL10 201002821\Diesel Engine [VCP384031] 16 Dec 2022 @ 2952.0 hrs

