
[[SWA142888]] VOLVO L110H 10425 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP368737
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: SWA142888

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10287143Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 14 Jan 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05737545 (Generated: 12/13/2023 09:26:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP368737 VCP326422 VCP305295 VCP244795Sample Date 06 Jan 2023 08 Oct 2021 11 Mar 2021 30 Oct 2020Machine Hours 9253 8490 7265 6382Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.60 7.53 7.48 7.39Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT NT 0 NTPercentage Glycol % 46.8 46 48 51Freezing Point °C -26 -29 -34 -41
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal normalCoolant Color Orange Orange Green Yllow

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05737545 (Generated: 12/13/2023 09:26:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 10425\Coolant [VCP368737] 06 Jan 2023 @ 9253.0 hrs

