
[[W07011941-1 STANLEY]] VOLVO A45G 342393 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP401342
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: W07011941-1 STANLEY

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10295415Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 18 Jan 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05740816 (Generated: 08/02/2023 15:15:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP401342 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Jan 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6044 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 57 --- --- ---Copper ppm 147 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3459 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 37 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1378 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1201 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 101 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05740816 (Generated: 08/02/2023 15:15:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342393\Brake Cooling System [VCP401342] 13 Jan 2023 @ 6044.0 hrs

