
[[HERC RENTALS]] VOLVO EC220EL 310988 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEMSample No: VCP397492
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAjohn.fardella@altg.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of silt (particulates < 6microns in size) present in the oil. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10309076Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 26 Jan 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05749472 (Generated: 06/11/2024 15:55:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VCP397492 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Jan 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1997 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1997 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 48.9 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.48 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 68929 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 5158 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 22 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/12 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 8 --- --- ---Copper ppm 46 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 175 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 445 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 353 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05749472 (Generated: 06/11/2024 15:55:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220EL 310988\Hydraulic System [VCP397492] 23 Jan 2023 @ 1997.0 hrs

