
[[HORST]] VOLVO EC460CL 110503 - RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP348812
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: HORST

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CO200 BURKHOLDER DR.EPHRATA, PAUS  17522Contact: CHAD HERRONchad@hwyequip.comT: (717)859-3132F: (717)859-2698
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Bearing and/or bushingwear is indicated. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: INSEPHUnique No: 10321056Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Feb 2023
Report Id: INSEPH [WUSCAR] 05756449 (Generated: 07/12/2023 11:54:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - INSEPH

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP348812 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Jan 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9014 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 199 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 135 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 13 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 401 --- --- ---Copper ppm 148 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 44 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 2 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 40 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 37 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 544 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 11 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: INSEPH [WUSCAR] 05756449 (Generated: 07/12/2023 11:54:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - INSEPH
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC460CL 110503\Right Final Drive [VCP348812] 27 Jan 2023 @ 9014.0 hrs

