
SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2888 - TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)

Sample No: VCP0007101
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40
Job No:

COMMERCIAL METALS COMPANY410 ATANDO AVECHARLOTTE, NCUS  28206Contact: JOHN PELOSOjohn.peloso@cmc.comT: (813)613-5034F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: COMCHAVCUnique No: 10325743Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Feb 2023
Report Id: COMCHAVC [WUSCAR] 05761136 (Generated: 06/30/2023 11:10:19) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007101 VCP356523 --- ---Sample Date 04 Feb 2023 21 Mar 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2462 1061 --- ---Oil Hours 1401 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.9 48.3 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 4 --- ---Sodium ppm 33 37 --- ---Potassium ppm 3 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 42 31 --- ---Copper ppm 45 33 --- ---Lead ppm 1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 4 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 32 35 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3410 3691 --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 9 --- ---Zinc ppm 1129 1147 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1041 1163 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 4 11 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COMCHAVC [WUSCAR] 05761136 (Generated: 06/30/2023 11:10:21) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2888\Transmission (Manual) [VCP0007101] 04 Feb 2023 @ 2462.0 hrs

