
[[39270 DOUBLE D MINE]] VOLVO L220G 12911 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP399608
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 39270 DOUBLE D MINE

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: JUSTIN VOSBURGHjustin.vosburgh@vcesvolvo.comT: F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is abnormal.Moderate concentration of visiblemetal present. There is no indicationof any contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 10326143Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Feb 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05761536 (Generated: 08/01/2023 11:48:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN VOSBURGH - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP399608 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Feb 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10556 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 26.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 204 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 45 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 51 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 23 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 162 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 57 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05761536 (Generated: 08/01/2023 11:48:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN VOSBURGH - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220G 12911\Transmission (Auto) [VCP399608] 01 Feb 2023 @ 10556.0 hrs

