
[[SWA150612-10]] VOLVO EC220EL 310769 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP278990
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SWA150612-10

ULSTER COUNTY RESOURCE RECOVERY AGENCY999 FLATBUSH AVEKINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: CHARLES WHITTAKERcwhf@ucrra.netT: (845)399-2686F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thechromium level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.The amount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The AN levelis acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: ULSKINUnique No: 10331580Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Feb 2023
Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05761972 (Generated: 02/08/2024 12:57:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP278990 VCP321794 VCP289254 VCP241233Sample Date 12 Jan 2023 26 Aug 2021 17 Sep 2020 28 Feb 2019Machine Hours 6114 4369 3051 1013Oil Hours 1075 1000 3000 1013Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 37.9 40.5 40.3 43.41Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.43 0.568 0.719 0.475
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 22512 62796 34527 21576Particles >6µm 1187 463 1175 4637Particles >14µm 75 101 25 423ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/17/13 23/16/14 22/17/12 22/19/16Silicon ppm 7 5 5 4Sodium ppm 5 3 3 1Potassium ppm 0 <1 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 6 4 2Copper ppm 20 21 16 13Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm 15 18 8 1Molybdenum ppm 7 2 2 0Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 670 533 521 88Magnesium ppm 47 20 19 <1Zinc ppm 495 555 561 482Phosphorus ppm 416 437 418 393Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 17 19 16 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05761972 (Generated: 02/08/2024 12:57:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220EL 310769\Hydraulic System [VCP278990] 12 Jan 2023 @ 6114.0 hrs

