
[[SWA120029-10]] VOLVO L110H 631934 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP390555
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: SWA120029-10

ULSTER COUNTY RESOURCE RECOVERY AGENCY999 FLATBUSH AVEKINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: CHARLES WHITTAKERcwhf@ucrra.netT: (845)399-2686F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: ULSKINUnique No: 10332310Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Feb 2023
Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05762702 (Generated: 02/08/2024 14:18:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP390555 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Dec 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1075 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.78 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 50.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -35 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05762702 (Generated: 02/08/2024 14:19:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631934\Coolant [VCP390555] 22 Dec 2022 @ 1075.0 hrs

