
[[SWA162865 RANGO]] VOLVO A45G 342450 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP403422
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SWA162865 RANGO

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT613 E STEVENSON RDOTTAWA, ILUS  61350Contact: KEVIN SKRTICHKEVIN.SKRTICH@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5055Unique No: 10337105Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 Feb 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 05767497 (Generated: 08/15/2023 16:10:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN SKRTICH - VOLVO5055

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP403422 VCP365282 VCP377325 VCP346309Sample Date 08 Feb 2023 18 Aug 2022 25 Jun 2022 05 Mar 2022Machine Hours 8555 7320 6792 6155Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 149 142 143 52.4
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 20 16 13 21Sodium ppm 0 0 0 0Potassium ppm 1 1 0 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1481 534 408 289Copper ppm 15 13 11 7Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 4 4 4 <1Chromium ppm 20 8 7 2Molybdenum ppm 11 4 4 3Nickel ppm 12 <1 1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 14 8 7 6Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 440 2153 2045 69Magnesium ppm 6 22 21 1Zinc ppm 199 799 721 76Phosphorus ppm 1642 1132 987 2131Barium ppm 0 0 4 0Boron ppm 114 95 81 196

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 05767497 (Generated: 08/15/2023 16:10:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN SKRTICH - VOLVO5055
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342450\Drop Box [VCP403422] 08 Feb 2023 @ 8555.0 hrs

