
[[SPM502739 OMNISOURCE]] SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.2100 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP399363
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: SPM502739 OMNISOURCE

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLCG-3283 S. DORT HIGHWAYBURTON, MIUS  48529Contact: BURTON SERVICEBURTON.SERVICE@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5023Unique No: 10344570Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Feb 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 05769953 (Generated: 11/07/2023 12:31:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURTON SERVICE - VOLVO5023

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP399363 VCP290699 VCP261604 ---Sample Date 10 Feb 2023 19 Nov 2020 09 Jan 2020 ---Machine Hours 8011 5907 5012 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 139 115 54.3 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 6 8 ---Sodium ppm 9 13 20 ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 109 97 127 ---Copper ppm 14 27 84 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 2 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 1 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 1 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 314 977 3219 ---Magnesium ppm 2 4 8 ---Zinc ppm 123 401 1217 ---Phosphorus ppm 1676 2052 1066 ---Barium ppm 1 0 3 ---Boron ppm 105 139 76 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 05769953 (Generated: 11/07/2023 12:31:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURTON SERVICE - VOLVO5023
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.2100\Front Left Final Drive [VCP399363] 10 Feb 2023 @ 8011.0 hrs

