
[[X46282]] VOLVO L180H 5666 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP395113
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X46282

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Shreveport945 NORTH MARKET STREETSHREVEPORT, LAUS  71107-6744Contact: KENNY COLEMANkcoleman@scottcompanies.comT: (318)226-9696F: (318)698-2295
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO2603Unique No: 10360592Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Mar 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2603 [WUSCAR] 05780922 (Generated: 01/02/2024 10:58:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY COLEMAN - VOLVO2603

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP395113 VCP395088 --- ---Sample Date 23 Feb 2023 22 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 483 483 --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 12 --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.41 2.34 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.004 0.004 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silicon ppm <1 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2603 [WUSCAR] 05780922 (Generated: 01/02/2024 10:58:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY COLEMAN - VOLVO2603
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5666\Diesel Fuel [VCP395113] 23 Feb 2023 @ 483.0 hrs

