
[[48098]] VOLVO EC480EL 310276 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP423547
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 48098

367 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - BUFORD3779 RYDER BLVDBUFORD, GAUS  30519Contact: Dana Vaccarodana.vaccaro@ascendummachinery.comT: (678)318-9500F: (678)318-9534
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak.Recommend drain oil if not alreadydone and flush before refilling withoil. We recommend that you inspectthe component for an overhauldetermination. Please note that theoil was too contaminated to performsome of the normal laboratorytests.All component wear rates arenormal. Sodium and/or potassiumlevels are high. Appearance isunacceptable There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. There is a high concentration ofglycol present in the oil. There is amoderate amount of visible siltpresent in the sample. Excessive freewater present. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8529Unique No: 10384950Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 22 Mar 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 05795266 (Generated: 12/28/2023 14:46:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423547 VCP197490 VCP196548 ---Sample Date 19 Mar 2023 18 Mar 2017 29 Jun 2016 ---Machine Hours 0 2128 1110 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL SEVERE ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt --- 13.23 13.7 ---Oxidation (PA) % --- 48 52 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 24.3 NEG NEG ---Soot % % --- 0 0 ---Nitration (PA) % --- 50 58 ---Sulfation (PA) % --- 47 50 ---Glycol % 0.10 NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 11 6 40 ---Sodium ppm 754 16 12 ---Potassium ppm 6 2 4 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 9 22 ---Copper ppm 2 18 150 ---Lead ppm <1 0 3 ---Tin ppm <1 0 4 ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 10 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 39 55 44 ---Nickel ppm 1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 2 1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 593 1370 1383 ---Magnesium ppm 166 837 758 ---Zinc ppm 619 1013 1013 ---Phosphorus ppm 506 811 833 ---Barium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Boron ppm 174 29 16 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 05795266 (Generated: 12/28/2023 14:46:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 310276\Diesel Engine [VCP423547] 19 Mar 2023 @ .0 hrs

