
[[SW1013401 TERRA FIRM]] VOLVO L110H 631395 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP396567
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SW1013401 TERRA FIRM

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4136 NORTH DONOVAN WAYLAS VEGAS, NVUS  89030Contact: TONY SHAWtshaw@arnoldmachinery.comT: (702)642-9000F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal. The amount andsize of particulates present in thesystem are acceptable. The AN levelis acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO5856Unique No: 10389290Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 27 Mar 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5856 [WUSCAR] 05799606 (Generated: 11/29/2023 15:47:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY SHAW - VOLVO5856

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP396567 VCP346010 VCP313523 VCP291930Sample Date 16 Mar 2023 13 Oct 2022 02 Mar 2022 12 Jan 2021Machine Hours 7586 6672 5220 3496Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed N/A N/ASample Status ABNORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.4 42.1 44.3 41.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.40 0.40 0.39 0.311
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 3145 12215 18591 9953Particles >6µm 668 1701 3155 2018Particles >14µm 24 104 119 151ISO 4406:1999 (c) 19/17/12 21/18/14 21/19/14 20/18/14Silicon ppm 50 4 5 4Sodium ppm 0 1 <1 <1Potassium ppm 2 0 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 10 10 8Copper ppm 3 7 6 5Lead ppm <1 2 2 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 2 0Chromium ppm <1 2 1 1Molybdenum ppm 9 1 2 1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 311 195 201 102Magnesium ppm 55 21 23 4Zinc ppm 423 460 505 436Phosphorus ppm 342 356 385 339Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 13 0 1 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5856 [WUSCAR] 05799606 (Generated: 11/29/2023 15:47:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY SHAW - VOLVO5856
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631395\Hydraulic System [VCP396567] 16 Mar 2023 @ 7586.0 hrs

