
[[SW1013401 TERRA]] VOLVO L110H 631395 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP396522
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: SW1013401 TERRA

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4136 NORTH DONOVAN WAYLAS VEGAS, NVUS  89030Contact: JOHN VENTURAjventura@arnoldmachinery.comT: (702)642-9000F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5856Unique No: 10389671Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Mar 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5856 [WUSCAR] 05799987 (Generated: 11/29/2023 15:47:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN VENTURA - VOLVO5856

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP396522 VCP385586 VCP313516 VCP301656Sample Date 16 Mar 2023 13 Oct 2022 02 Mar 2022 12 Jan 2021Machine Hours 7586 6672 5220 3496Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed N/A N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 47.9 47.3 47.7 47.7
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 5 14 14 15Sodium ppm <1 2 6 7Potassium ppm <1 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 146 281 167 84Copper ppm 2 10 8 3Lead ppm <1 1 1 2Tin ppm <1 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 1 2 1 <1Chromium ppm 2 3 2 2Molybdenum ppm 1 2 2 0Nickel ppm 1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 2 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 5 4 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3139 3612 3395 3855Magnesium ppm 7 13 14 12Zinc ppm 1326 1442 1266 1499Phosphorus ppm 1152 1211 1080 1207Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 21 103 110 107

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5856 [WUSCAR] 05799987 (Generated: 11/29/2023 15:47:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN VENTURA - VOLVO5856
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631395\Front Axle [VCP396522] 16 Mar 2023 @ 7586.0 hrs

