
[[48117]] VOLVO LC450H 1015 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP423545
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 48117

367 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - BUFORD3779 RYDER BLVDBUFORD, GAUS  30519Contact: Dana Vaccarodana.vaccaro@ascendummachinery.comT: (678)318-9500F: (678)318-9534
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8529Unique No: 10403287Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Apr 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 05805758 (Generated: 08/21/2023 07:51:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423545 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Mar 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.241 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 373 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 11 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3943 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1481 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1210 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 108 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 05805758 (Generated: 08/21/2023 07:51:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO LC450H 1015\Rear Axle [VCP423545] 23 Mar 2023 @ .0 hrs

