
[[734641 MARTIN MARIET]] VOLVO A60H 350019 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP420969
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 734641 MARTIN MARIET

ROMCO INC - AUSTIN BRANCH1150 WEST OLD SETTLERS BOULEVARDROUNDROCK, TXUS  78681Contact: MATT MACHANNmmachann@romco.comT: (832)270-0121F: (512)845-7565
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. The oilchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Test for glycol is positive.There is a high concentration ofglycol present in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0088Unique No: 10406144Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 07 Apr 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05808615 (Generated: 09/23/2023 13:45:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MACHANN - VOLVO0088

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420969 VCP318531 VCP302584 VCP271812Sample Date 28 Mar 2023 07 Aug 2021 03 Mar 2021 22 Jan 2021Machine Hours 5556 3377 2742 2583Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 12.7 13.2 12.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 60 71 67 69
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.3 0.7Nitration (PA) % 52 92 56 69Sulfation (PA) % 60 80 64 64Glycol % 0.10 0.10 NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 11 5 6Sodium ppm 230 1201 11 1Potassium ppm 305 382 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 18 7 15Copper ppm 2 51 4 21Lead ppm 0 2 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 4 5Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 173 141 115 108Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1617 1490 1500 1536Magnesium ppm 656 667 608 560Zinc ppm 913 912 827 889Phosphorus ppm 749 850 742 781Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 279 127 297 240

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05808615 (Generated: 09/23/2023 13:45:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MACHANN - VOLVO0088
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350019\Diesel Engine [VCP420969] 28 Mar 2023 @ 5556.0 hrs

