
[[SPM539371 CONGRA]] VOLVO L120H 632390 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP410707
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SPM539371 CONGRA

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLCG-3283 S. DORT HIGHWAYBURTON, MIUS  48529Contact: BURTON SERVICEBURTON.SERVICE@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5023Unique No: 10444387Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 28 Apr 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 05830894 (Generated: 06/30/2023 13:04:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURTON SERVICE - VOLVO5023

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410707 VCP396613 VCP374320 VCP379064Sample Date 17 Apr 2023 02 Mar 2023 11 Jan 2023 19 Oct 2022Machine Hours 15627 15076 14386 13764Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 15.0 14.9 15.3 11.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.1 9.6 9.4 9.3Oxidation (PA) % 60 62 60 71
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.3 0.3 0.2Nitration (PA) % 58 63 60 79Sulfation (PA) % 52 53 53 57Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 0 2 4 5Sodium ppm 2 0 0 3Potassium ppm <1 1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 12 10 5Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 1Lead ppm 0 <1 1 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 3 3 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 2Molybdenum ppm 58 59 59 55Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 1 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1086 1081 1132 1323Magnesium ppm 1016 927 982 806Zinc ppm 1313 1227 1332 1251Phosphorus ppm 1080 1013 1014 1014Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 12

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 05830894 (Generated: 06/30/2023 13:09:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURTON SERVICE - VOLVO5023
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632390\Diesel Engine [VCP410707] 17 Apr 2023 @ 15627.0 hrs

