
[[SPM538996 ALTA RENTS]] TAKEUCHI TL12R2 412105347 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP400775
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 10W30
Job No: SPM538996 ALTA RENTS

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLCG-3283 S. DORT HIGHWAYBURTON, MIUS  48529Contact: BURTON SERVICEBURTON.SERVICE@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. We were unable to performa particle count due to a highconcentration of particles present inthis sample.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5023Unique No: 10444586Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 28 Apr 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 05831093 (Generated: 06/30/2023 13:10:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURTON SERVICE - VOLVO5023

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP400775 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Apr 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 524 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.1 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.84 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 16 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3815 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 747 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 613 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 14 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 05831093 (Generated: 06/30/2023 13:10:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURTON SERVICE - VOLVO5023
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL12R2 412105347\Hydraulic System [VCP400775] 17 Apr 2023 @ 524.0 hrs

