
[[SWO061719 LORIS TRAN]] BOMAG GW120 101880571055 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP376323
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SWO061719 LORIS TRAN

COWIN EQUIPMENT - ATLANTA5710 RIVERVIEW RDMABLETON, GAUS  30126Contact: MIKE ANDREWSmandrews@cowin.comT: (404)690-7210F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for possiblecoolant leak. Check for low coolantlevel. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Metal levels are typical fora new component breaking in.Sodium and/or potassium levels arehigh. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil.

Depot: COWMABUnique No: 10446917Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 02 May 2023
Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 05833424 (Generated: 03/25/2024 13:26:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP376323 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Apr 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 572 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 83 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 100 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 75 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 30 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 71 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 223 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 199 --- --- ---Copper ppm 41 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 56 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 26 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2827 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 211 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1371 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1130 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 28 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 05833424 (Generated: 03/25/2024 13:26:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	BOMAG BOMAG GW120 101880571055\Diesel Engine [VCP376323] 27 Apr 2023 @ 571.9 hrs

