
[[SWA233774-10]] VOLVO EC220E 314027 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP408560
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 101
Job No: SWA233774-10

ULSTER COUNTY RESOURCE RECOVERY AGENCY999 FLATBUSH AVEKINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: CHARLES WHITTAKERcwhf@ucrra.netT: (845)399-2686F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Confirmoil type. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: ULSKINUnique No: 10456823Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 08 May 2023
Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05838020 (Generated: 01/04/2024 09:04:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408560 VCP323594 VCP313825 VCP267802Sample Date 27 Apr 2023 21 Sep 2021 15 Apr 2021 17 Sep 2020Machine Hours 6997 4100 3159 1980Oil Hours 0 1000 1000 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 154 165 295 107
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 3 2 3 6Sodium ppm 2 <1 2 2Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 39 26 38 46Copper ppm <1 0 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 89 41 191 1055Magnesium ppm 26 14 56 576Zinc ppm 65 20 71 579Phosphorus ppm 1050 1027 976 665Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 180 186 198 76

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05838020 (Generated: 01/04/2024 09:05:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220E 314027\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP408560] 27 Apr 2023 @ 6997.0 hrs

