
[[SWA233774-10]] VOLVO EC220E 314027 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP407394
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 101
Job No: SWA233774-10

ULSTER COUNTY RESOURCE RECOVERY AGENCY999 FLATBUSH AVEKINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: CHARLES WHITTAKERcwhf@ucrra.netT: (845)399-2686F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal. Thisplus the additive levels indicates theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: ULSKINUnique No: 10456828Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 08 May 2023
Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05838025 (Generated: 01/04/2024 09:04:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407394 VCP323028 VCP303775 VCP267806Sample Date 27 Apr 2023 21 Sep 2021 15 Apr 2021 17 Sep 2020Machine Hours 6997 4100 3159 1980Oil Hours 0 1000 1000 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 164 154 295 102
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 6 1 2 6Sodium ppm 2 <1 2 2Potassium ppm 2 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 76 14 34 29Copper ppm <1 0 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 2Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 <1 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 68 132 215 1187Magnesium ppm 18 22 42 655Zinc ppm 41 77 76 654Phosphorus ppm 1039 1008 988 731Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 182 180 199 85

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05838025 (Generated: 01/04/2024 09:04:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220E 314027\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP407394] 27 Apr 2023 @ 6997.0 hrs

