
[[VLS]] VOLVO EC200EL 314325 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP395153
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: VLS

216 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - PIEDMONT407 OAK ROADPIEDMONT, SCUS  29673Contact: KEMP COBLEkemp.coble@ascendummachinery.comT: (864)704-1060F: (864)704-1069
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.The tin level is severe.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO4596Unique No: 10457791Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 May 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4596 [WUSCAR] 05838988 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:39:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEMP COBLE - VOLVO4596

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP395153 VCP382678 VCP370329 VCP366260Sample Date 24 Apr 2023 31 Jan 2023 08 Nov 2022 15 Aug 2022Machine Hours 4515 3974 3465 2973Oil Hours 500 500 500 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 12.9 12.3 13.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.7 9.6 8.8 11.9Oxidation (PA) % 83 86 105 82
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.3 0.8 0.1Nitration (PA) % 70 70 87 49Sulfation (PA) % 57 62 73 65Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 2.7 <1.0Silicon ppm 34 33 64 22Sodium ppm 5 1 1 2Potassium ppm <1 2 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 25 37 69 8Copper ppm 2 3 5 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 43 35 67 17Aluminum ppm 10 19 49 22Chromium ppm 4 4 7 2Molybdenum ppm 45 47 44 41Nickel ppm 3 2 3 1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 1 2 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1750 1832 1773 1642Magnesium ppm 598 508 483 464Zinc ppm 1260 1188 1159 1106Phosphorus ppm 987 987 912 938Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 27 30 20 55

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4596 [WUSCAR] 05838988 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:39:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEMP COBLE - VOLVO4596
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200EL 314325\Diesel Engine [VCP395153] 24 Apr 2023 @ 4515.0 hrs

