
[[SPM540449]] VOLVO L220E 2194 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP404603
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SPM540449

WASTE MANAGEMENT - GARY1508 SHERMAN STGARY, INUS  46406Contact: TARA RORK
T: F: 
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of silt (particulates< 14 microns in size) present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The oil is still serviceableprovided that the contaminant(s) canbe reduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: WASGARINUnique No: 10457937Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 08 May 2023
Report Id: WASGARIN [WUSCAR] 05839134 (Generated: 08/15/2023 13:09:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TARA RORK - WASGARIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP404603 VCP365278 VCP05526748 ---Sample Date 25 Apr 2023 10 Oct 2022 14 Apr 2022 ---Machine Hours 24189 25053 25025 ---Oil Hours 0 0 25025 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.7 42.8 43.1 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.33 0.36 0.43 ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 27824 25098 21727 ---Particles >6µm 4351 2459 2325 ---Particles >14µm 197 63 122 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/19/15 22/18/13 22/18/14 ---Silicon ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Sodium ppm 0 0 0 ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 2 2 ---Copper ppm 4 4 4 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 1 1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 0 0 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 86 82 77 ---Magnesium ppm 2 4 4 ---Zinc ppm 511 512 467 ---Phosphorus ppm 414 388 354 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 0 2 2 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASGARIN [WUSCAR] 05839134 (Generated: 08/15/2023 13:09:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TARA RORK - WASGARIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220E 2194\Hydraulic System [VCP404603] 25 Apr 2023 @ 24189.0 hrs

