
[[W07012306 STANLEY]] VOLVO A45G 342207 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP396732
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: W07012306 STANLEY

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The nickellevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10466941Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 12 May 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05842834 (Generated: 08/24/2023 07:53:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP396732 VCP372948 VCP277835 VCP245637Sample Date 02 May 2023 28 Jul 2022 01 Jul 2020 17 Dec 2019Machine Hours 9278 7899 3901 3200Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed N/ASample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.7 26.6 26.8 24.4
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 7 19 8Sodium ppm 4 8 4 5Potassium ppm 2 0 4 7
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 33 67 34 36Copper ppm 76 150 81 22Lead ppm 0 1 0 <1Tin ppm 8 17 8 1Aluminum ppm 16 34 12 12Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 0Nickel ppm 14 26 13 2Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 3 4 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 95 114 105 172Magnesium ppm 0 0 <1 1Zinc ppm 0 13 11 27Phosphorus ppm 212 181 164 223Barium ppm 0 0 2 0Boron ppm 88 75 67 65

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05842834 (Generated: 08/24/2023 07:53:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342207\Transmission (Auto) [VCP396732] 02 May 2023 @ 9278.0 hrs

