
[[RS0-033963]] VOLVO EC480EL 315025 - LEFT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP383079
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: RS0-033963

MIDSOUTH PAVING INC750 CLOW RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35217Contact: CHRIS MCCOYchmccoy@apac.comT: (205)365-3448F: (205)808-5431
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: APABIRUnique No: 10469994Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 May 2023
Report Id: APABIR [WUSCAR] 05845887 (Generated: 06/28/2024 11:56:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS MCCOY - APABIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP383079 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 526 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 185 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 50 --- --- ---Copper ppm 12 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 25 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 11 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 325 --- --- ---Barium ppm 4 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: APABIR [WUSCAR] 05845887 (Generated: 06/28/2024 11:56:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS MCCOY - APABIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 315025\Left Swing Drive [VCP383079] 14 May 2023 @ 526.0 hrs

