
[[SWA236990-10]] VOLVO L150H 6858 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP367518
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: SWA236990-10

MORIARTY TREE168 MILTON TURNPIKEMILTON, NYUS  12547Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Tests do not reveal causefor reported problem.All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: MORMILNYUnique No: 10470057Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 May 2023
Report Id: MORMILNY [WUSCAR] 05845950 (Generated: 09/11/2023 08:36:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - MORMILNY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP367518 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3575 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 76 --- --- ---Copper ppm 8 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 262 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 103 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 233 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 71 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MORMILNY [WUSCAR] 05845950 (Generated: 09/11/2023 08:36:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - MORMILNY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6858\Transmission [VCP367518] 05 May 2023 @ 3575.0 hrs

