
[[SW1018499]] VOLVO EC250DL 210257 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP397942
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SW1018499

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend you service the filters onthis component. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. We wereunable to perform a particle countdue to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Theiron level is abnormal. Elementallevels of silicon (Si) and aluminum(Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarsedirt) ingress. High concentration ofvisible dirt/debris present in the oil.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oilsadditive package is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10471138Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 May 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05847031 (Generated: 03/13/2024 23:10:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP397942 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5498 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 48.5 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.76 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 87 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 75 --- --- ---Copper ppm 19 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 28 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 2 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2360 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 50 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1130 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 870 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 74 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05847031 (Generated: 03/13/2024 23:10:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250DL 210257\Hydraulic System [VCP397942] 03 May 2023 @ 5498.0 hrs

