
[[HANSON AGGREGATES]] VOLVO L250H 1237 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP384060
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: HANSON AGGREGATES

160 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - MILLS RIVER215 FANNING FIELDS RDMILLS RIVER, NCUS  28759Contact: CORY PENLANDcory.penland@ascendummachinery.comT: (828)687-0620F: (828)687-0622
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The wear metal levels donot reflect the suspected failure.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO1672Unique No: 10481020Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 May 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1672 [WUSCAR] 05851665 (Generated: 10/09/2023 16:08:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CORY PENLAND - VOLVO1672

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP384060 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 14629 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.0 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 80 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 48 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 45 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1792 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 540 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 951 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 810 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 68 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1672 [WUSCAR] 05851665 (Generated: 10/09/2023 16:08:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CORY PENLAND - VOLVO1672
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L250H 1237\Diesel Engine [VCP384060] 17 May 2023 @ 14629.0 hrs

