
[TMR-LANDSTREET [553534]] 562176 VOLVO EC380 314718 - GEARBOX

Sample No: VCP422236
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 553534

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - ORLANDO - LANDSTREET51 EAST LANDSTREET ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: F: (407)855-3118
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: TRAORLFLUnique No: 10481961Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 24 May 2023
Report Id: TRAORLFL [WUSCAR] 05852606 (Generated: 05/15/2024 16:10:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAORLFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422236 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2795 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 272 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.205 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 196 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 7 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 125 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 43 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 117 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1031 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 128 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAORLFL [WUSCAR] 05852606 (Generated: 05/15/2024 16:11:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAORLFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 562176 VOLVO EC380 314718\Gearbox [VCP422236] 12 May 2023 @ 2795.0 hrs

