
[[W0228184 ITS]] ALJON 600 30135 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP365562
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: W0228184 ITS

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: CHRIS BITNERCBitner@romco.comT: F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. The oil change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is a veryhigh amount of fuel present in theoil. Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 10482261Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 May 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 05852906 (Generated: 07/10/2023 13:45:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP365562 VCP393228 VCP381213 ---Sample Date 17 May 2023 18 Jan 2023 09 Dec 2022 ---Machine Hours 1300 512 189 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 6.2 11.7 12.1 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.8 8.1 10.6 ---Oxidation (PA) % 51 60 58 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 ---Nitration (PA) % 53 63 53 ---Sulfation (PA) % 52 52 53 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 31.2 <1.0 0.9 ---Silicon ppm 6 26 20 ---Sodium ppm 1 <1 2 ---Potassium ppm 0 2 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 22 13 ---Copper ppm <1 18 5 ---Lead ppm <1 2 1 ---Tin ppm <1 4 3 ---Aluminum ppm <1 1 1 ---Chromium ppm 0 2 1 ---Molybdenum ppm 78 63 61 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 947 1277 1302 ---Magnesium ppm 386 799 815 ---Zinc ppm 532 1203 1183 ---Phosphorus ppm 466 996 1018 ---Barium ppm 0 1 0 ---Boron ppm 204 4 10 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 05852906 (Generated: 07/10/2023 13:45:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 600 30135\Diesel Engine [VCP365562] 17 May 2023 @ 1300.0 hrs

