
KENWORTH T270 7319 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP408559
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER TRANSMISSION OIL SAE 30
Job No:

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - SALEM2025 COOK DRIVESALEM, VAUS  24153Contact: SCOTT CARRscarr@mcclung-logan.comT: (540)418-5218F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO9010Unique No: 10484347Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 25 May 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05854992 (Generated: 12/29/2023 14:15:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT CARR - VOLVO9010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408559 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 6000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.6 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.30 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 32992 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 5780 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 305 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/20/15 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 49 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 464 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 332 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05854992 (Generated: 12/29/2023 14:16:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT CARR - VOLVO9010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KENWORTH KENWORTH T270 7319\Hydraulic System [VCP408559] 22 May 2023 @ .0 hrs

