
[[X43639]] VOLVO A40F 11840 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP418781
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: X43639

ROGERS GROUP, INC421 GREAT CIRCLE ROADNASHVILLE, TNUS  37228Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (615)780-5730F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ROGNASUnique No: 10486211Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 30 May 2023
Report Id: ROGNAS [WUSCAR] 05856856 (Generated: 09/07/2023 10:02:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - ROGNAS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418781 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 21392 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 110 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.329 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 93 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 16 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 614 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 28 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 11 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 3 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 15 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2959 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 94 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 789 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1387 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 162 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ROGNAS [WUSCAR] 05856856 (Generated: 09/07/2023 10:02:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - ROGNAS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40F 11840\Rear Axle [VCP418781] 23 May 2023 @ 21392.0 hrs

