
[[554891 ALTA RENTS]] TAKEUCHI TL10 410006539 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP417320
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 554891 ALTA RENTS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10499201Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 07 Jun 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05864736 (Generated: 09/22/2023 14:05:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417320 VCP421082 --- ---Sample Date 31 May 2023 21 Mar 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 437 169 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 159 157 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 47 39 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1310 695 --- ---Copper ppm 3 2 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 16 8 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 13 8 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 113 36 --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 60 41 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 278 256 --- ---Barium ppm 0 16 --- ---Boron ppm 11 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05864736 (Generated: 09/22/2023 14:05:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL10 410006539\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP417320] 31 May 2023 @ 437.0 hrs

