
[[GAETA]] CUMMINS GAETA CUMMINS QSB 4.5 (S/N NOT GIVEN) - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP401574
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: GAETA

GREEN MACHINE SERVICES LLC13 SPYROS DRIVESOUTH AMBOY, NJUS  08879Contact: JOE GRZANKOWSKIJOE@GREENMSRV.COMT: (732)673-5920F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. We advise that youcheck the air filter, air inductionsystem, and any areas where dirt mayenter the component. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of fuel present in the oil.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal. Fuel is present in the oil andis lowering the viscosity. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: GRESOUNJUnique No: 10506281Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 08 Jun 2023
Report Id: GRESOUNJ [WUSCAR] 05866497 (Generated: 10/19/2023 08:41:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE GRZANKOWSKI - GRESOUNJ

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP401574 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4780 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 110 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 88 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 69 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 3.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 47 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 50 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1839 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 517 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1188 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 946 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 28 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GRESOUNJ [WUSCAR] 05866497 (Generated: 10/19/2023 08:41:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE GRZANKOWSKI - GRESOUNJ
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CUMMINS CUMMINS GAETA CUMMINS QSB 4.5 (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Diesel Engine [VCP401574] 13 May 2023 @ 4780.0 hrs

