
[[CAMP AUTO]] CUMMINS CAMP AUTO CUMMINS 6.7 (S/N NOT GIVEN) - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP401573
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: CAMP AUTO

GREEN MACHINE SERVICES LLC13 SPYROS DRIVESOUTH AMBOY, NJUS  08879Contact: JOE GRZANKOWSKIJOE@GREENMSRV.COMT: (732)673-5920F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: GRESOUNJUnique No: 10506291Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 09 Jun 2023
Report Id: GRESOUNJ [WUSCAR] 05866507 (Generated: 08/16/2023 15:07:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE GRZANKOWSKI - GRESOUNJ

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP401573 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 21865 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 8.72 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 4.3 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 32 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 37 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 44 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.2 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 39 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 663 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 186 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 739 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 619 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 173 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GRESOUNJ [WUSCAR] 05866507 (Generated: 08/16/2023 15:07:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE GRZANKOWSKI - GRESOUNJ
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CUMMINS CUMMINS CAMP AUTO CUMMINS 6.7 (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Diesel Engine [VCP401573] 19 May 2023 @ 21865.0 hrs

