
[[SIMS]] SENNEBOGEN 840 840.0.2329 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP364606
Oil Type: MOBIL SHC 630
Job No: SIMS

GREEN MACHINE SERVICES LLC13 SPYROS DRIVESOUTH AMBOY, NJUS  08879Contact: JOE GRZANKOWSKIJOE@GREENMSRV.COMT: (732)673-5920F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: GRESOUNJUnique No: 10506789Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Jun 2023
Report Id: GRESOUNJ [WUSCAR] 05867005 (Generated: 08/16/2023 15:22:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE GRZANKOWSKI - GRESOUNJ

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP364606 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 199 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.282 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 922 --- --- ---Copper ppm 83 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 11 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 7 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 108 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 278 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 13 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GRESOUNJ [WUSCAR] 05867005 (Generated: 08/16/2023 15:22:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE GRZANKOWSKI - GRESOUNJ
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 840 840.0.2329\Swing Drive [VCP364606] 17 May 2023 @ .0 hrs

