
[[GEORGE GILBERT BOAT]] WAYNE BEAL WAYNE BEAL 40 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP189636
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T 40
Job No: GEORGE GILBERT BOAT

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC MAINPO BOX 4500WESTBROOK, MEUS  04098Contact: IAN LEVESQUEian.levesque@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)625-8181F: (207)854-8237
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0006Unique No: 10506888Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Jun 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 05867104 (Generated: 05/03/2024 13:27:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: IAN LEVESQUE - VOLVO0006

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP189636 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 400 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 93.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 --- --- ---Copper ppm 20 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 82 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2787 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 22 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1102 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 943 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 166 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 05867104 (Generated: 05/03/2024 13:27:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: IAN LEVESQUE - VOLVO0006
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	WAYNE BEAL WAYNE BEAL WAYNE BEAL 40\Transmission [VCP189636] 05 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

