
[[279845 FERROUS]] VOLVO L90H 624915 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP178290
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 279845 FERROUS

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5210 REESE ROADDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: DAVID YOUNGdavid.young@altg.comT: (954)581-4744F: (954)583-0318
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0095Unique No: 10511034Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 Jun 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 05871250 (Generated: 05/10/2024 13:02:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID YOUNG - VOLVO0095

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP178290 VCP373028 VCP348924 VCP344805Sample Date 07 Jun 2023 22 Jul 2022 05 Jan 2022 05 Oct 2021Machine Hours 3754 2519 1575 1082Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.3 40.5 40.5 40.4
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 11 16 10 10Sodium ppm 0 1 2 <1Potassium ppm 2 3 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 57 174 55 47Copper ppm 32 175 <1 1Lead ppm <1 2 0 <1Tin ppm 3 19 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 2 <1 4Chromium ppm 1 6 2 2Molybdenum ppm <1 4 9 10Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 2 10 6 6Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3975 4382 4000 4190Magnesium ppm 12 12 8 8Zinc ppm 1589 1771 1469 1627Phosphorus ppm 1299 1396 1264 1313Barium ppm 2 2 0 0Boron ppm 131 159 142 132

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 05871250 (Generated: 05/10/2024 13:02:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID YOUNG - VOLVO0095
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624915\Rear Axle [VCP178290] 07 Jun 2023 @ 3754.0 hrs

