
VOLVO EC160EL 310364 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP384763
Oil Type: CHEVRON MULTIGEAR EP5 80W90
Job No:

DH FUNK AND SONS LLC3995 CONTINENTAL DRIVECOLUMBIA, PAUS  17512Contact: GARY SHEPHERDGSHEPHERD@DHFUNK.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DHFCOLUnique No: 10522369Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 20 Jun 2023
Report Id: DHFCOL [WUSCAR] 05877266 (Generated: 08/10/2023 11:42:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY SHEPHERD - DHFCOL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP384763 VCP335947 --- ---Sample Date 13 Jun 2023 25 Mar 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 4000 3000 --- ---Oil Hours 1000 1000 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 126 119 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 14 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 0 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 59 91 --- ---Copper ppm 2 4 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 3 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 4 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 1 2 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 98 220 --- ---Magnesium ppm 35 95 --- ---Zinc ppm 59 125 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 941 1021 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 184 164 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DHFCOL [WUSCAR] 05877266 (Generated: 08/10/2023 11:42:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY SHEPHERD - DHFCOL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160EL 310364\Swing Drive [VCP384763] 13 Jun 2023 @ 4000.0 hrs

