
[[566312]] SENNEBOGEN 830 2567 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP393374
Oil Type: FLEETGUARD ES COMPLEAT
Job No: 566312

FERROUS PROCESSING AND TRADING3400 E LAFAYETTEDETROIT, MIUS  48207Contact: KEITH HALLkeith.hall@fpt1.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. Sediment present. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits. Glycol and nitritelevels are acceptable.

Depot: FERDETUnique No: 10526341Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Jun 2023
Report Id: FERDET [WUSCAR] 05881238 (Generated: 07/19/2023 13:42:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEITH HALL - FERDET

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP393374 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8895 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.06 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 1240 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 62.2 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -61 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance sediment --- --- ---Coolant Color Black --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FERDET [WUSCAR] 05881238 (Generated: 07/19/2023 13:42:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEITH HALL - FERDET
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 830 2567\Coolant [VCP393374] 19 Jun 2023 @ 8895.0 hrs

