
VOLVO A25D 72011 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP401520
Oil Type: BP AW 46
Job No:

LEONARDS CONTRACTING30850 STEPHENSON HWYMADISON HEIGHTS, MIUS  48071Contact: LARRY SCHRADElarry.schrade@sdevelop.comT: (810)499-1953F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a moderate amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. Elemental level ofsilicon (Si) above normal indicatingingress of seal material. The AN levelis acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: LEOMADUnique No: 10532856Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 30 Jun 2023
Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 05882373 (Generated: 06/30/2023 16:27:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP401520 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12895 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.4 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.40 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 84417 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 5152 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 20 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/20/11 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 32 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 790 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 635 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 483 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 19 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 05882373 (Generated: 06/30/2023 16:27:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25D 72011\Hydraulic System [VCP401520] 15 Jun 2023 @ 12895.0 hrs

