
[[S50600433 HERC]] DOOSAN XP825/HP750 501836UDAFF72 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP345490
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: S50600433 HERC

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT1944 MARINA BLVDSAN LEANDRO, CAUS  94577Contact: JOHN BUDESILICHjohn.budesilich@vcesvolvo.comT: F: (925)294-9240
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) ofrust.Light concentration of visiblemetal present as rust. There is a lightamount of visible silt/sedimentpresent in the sample. The watercontent is negligible. The conditionof the fuel appears acceptable forservice.

Depot: VOLVO4487Unique No: 10533314Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 06 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4487 [WUSCAR] 05882831 (Generated: 07/26/2023 14:19:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN BUDESILICH - VOLVO4487

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP345490 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1355 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.89 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.002 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4487 [WUSCAR] 05882831 (Generated: 07/26/2023 14:19:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN BUDESILICH - VOLVO4487
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	DOOSAN DOOSAN XP825/HP750 501836UDAFF72\Diesel Fuel [VCP345490] 21 Jun 2023 @ 1355.2 hrs

