
[[9156]] VOLVO EC350E 310571 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP407903
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO GEAR ESI OIL 85W140
Job No: 9156

RECYCLE 14700 LAWRENCE STHYATTSVILLE, MDUS  20781Contact: MIKE DESJARDINSmdesjarkins@wbwaste.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: RECHYAUnique No: 10535216Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 30 Jun 2023
Report Id: RECHYA [WUSCAR] 05884733 (Generated: 06/30/2023 10:51:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DESJARDINS - RECHYA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407903 VCP361414 VCP241557 VCP223368Sample Date 22 Jun 2023 21 Apr 2022 18 Apr 2019 17 Aug 2018Machine Hours 9970 7993 2007 488Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 284 170 58.9 181.7
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 4 3 5Sodium ppm 2 0 2 2Potassium ppm 6 1 20 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 34 40 53 56Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm <1 <1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 2 1 1 2Molybdenum ppm 4 16 <1 0Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 93 441 9 13Magnesium ppm 36 130 <1 4Zinc ppm 55 283 13 13Phosphorus ppm 981 966 1853 392Barium ppm 0 0 <1 1Boron ppm 180 185 198 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RECHYA [WUSCAR] 05884733 (Generated: 06/30/2023 10:51:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DESJARDINS - RECHYA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350E 310571\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP407903] 22 Jun 2023 @ 9970.0 hrs

