
VOLVO IPS 1 3194008190 - TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)

Sample No: VCP405470
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90
Job No:

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC MAIN4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: DARRIN BROWNdbrown@mcclung-logan.comT: (443)610-3793F:  x:
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Gear wear is indicated. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the fluid. The condition of the fluidis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10535243Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 30 Jun 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05884760 (Generated: 06/30/2023 13:03:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DARRIN BROWN - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405470 VCP340311 VCP291911 VCP261450Sample Date 30 May 2023 28 Apr 2022 07 Nov 2020 29 Apr 2020Machine Hours 1660 1570 1430 1245Oil Hours 90 130 185 150Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 100 101 71.3 41.7
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 11 11 9 5Sodium ppm 8 24 9 3Potassium ppm 3 0 <1 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 209 267 252 257Copper ppm 8 14 6 12Lead ppm 1 <1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 15 15 4 4Chromium ppm 2 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 0Nickel ppm 2 2 1 2Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 3 2 4 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 15 14 20 2Magnesium ppm 7 3 4 <1Zinc ppm 59 63 34 23Phosphorus ppm 1157 1340 966 501Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 10 68 9 6

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05884760 (Generated: 06/30/2023 13:03:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DARRIN BROWN - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO IPS 1 3194008190\Transmission (Manual) [VCP405470] 30 May 2023 @ 1660.0 hrs

