
[[6574 PINE TIMBER]] VOLVO L90H 624237 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP422908
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 6574 PINE TIMBER

364 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - MACON4807 HARRISON RDMACON, GAUS  31206Contact: ROGER PHILLIPSROGER.PHILLIPS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (478)200-5859
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All metal levelsare normal indicating no corrosion inthe cooling system. Sample consistsalmost entirely of free water. Fuel iscontaminated with coolant. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the fuel. The fuel is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: ASCMACUnique No: 10535800Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 06 Jul 2023
Report Id: ASCMAC [WUSCAR] 05885317 (Generated: 07/06/2023 09:43:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROGER PHILLIPS - ASCMAC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422908 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12927 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.69 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.011 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ASCMAC [WUSCAR] 05885317 (Generated: 07/06/2023 09:43:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROGER PHILLIPS - ASCMAC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624237\Diesel Fuel [VCP422908] 21 Jun 2023 @ 12927.0 hrs

