
[[SWO-063459]] VOLVO A45G 342067 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP424306
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: SWO-063459

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of particulates present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10536046Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 30 Jun 2023
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 05885563 (Generated: 06/30/2023 16:09:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424306 VCP393611 VCP367334 VCP366306Sample Date 22 Jun 2023 14 Feb 2023 03 Nov 2022 04 Aug 2022Machine Hours 6450 5835 5435 4970Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.8 43.1 43.5 43.2Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.34 0.31 0.34 0.33
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 21227 2087 3546 2022Particles >6µm 6558 504 926 261Particles >14µm 318 30 85 11ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/20/15 18/16/12 19/17/14 18/15/11Silicon ppm 8 6 5 5Sodium ppm 4 1 <1 0Potassium ppm 2 0 1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 10 11 10Copper ppm 8 7 7 7Lead ppm 3 2 3 3Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 2 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 1 1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 140 139 135 137Magnesium ppm 21 14 16 15Zinc ppm 426 424 438 435Phosphorus ppm 338 330 328 332Barium ppm <1 0 2 0Boron ppm 1 0 3 5

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 05885563 (Generated: 06/30/2023 16:10:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342067\Hydraulic System [VCP424306] 22 Jun 2023 @ 6450.0 hrs

