
[[SWO-063459]] VOLVO A45G 342067 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP424721
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO-063459

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10536407Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 02 Jul 2023
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 05885924 (Generated: 07/02/2023 12:06:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424721 VCP392783 VCP367375 VCP366686Sample Date 22 Jun 2023 14 Feb 2023 03 Nov 2022 04 Aug 2022Machine Hours 6450 5835 5435 4970Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.1 55.5 46.9 46.9
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 16 18 17 16Sodium ppm 4 6 4 5Potassium ppm <1 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 29 45 29 22Copper ppm 355 364 341 312Lead ppm 0 5 4 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 2 2 2Nickel ppm 5 6 6 4Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 2 2 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2990 3189 3255 3312Magnesium ppm 21 22 23 22Zinc ppm 1273 1255 1374 1381Phosphorus ppm 1150 1105 1145 1180Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 84 106 99 143

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 05885924 (Generated: 07/02/2023 12:06:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342067\Wet Disc Brake [VCP424721] 22 Jun 2023 @ 6450.0 hrs

