
[[SWO-063484]] VOLVO EC250E 310275 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP408949
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 90W140
Job No: SWO-063484

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10536412Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 02 Jul 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05885929 (Generated: 07/02/2023 12:05:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408949 VCP397100 VCP379939 VCP366782Sample Date 23 Jun 2023 17 Feb 2023 18 Oct 2022 25 Jul 2022Machine Hours 7550 7053 6547 6234Oil Hours 0 0 0 6234Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 312 291 193 328
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- --- --- 0.973Silicon ppm 591 836 722 2704Sodium ppm 19 31 23 71Potassium ppm 22 25 18 129
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1628 1576 832 3850Copper ppm <1 2 <1 4Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 184 120 120 754Chromium ppm 17 17 10 52Molybdenum ppm 4 4 4 10Nickel ppm 2 2 <1 4Titanium ppm 7 8 7 40Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 10 10 6 27Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 2
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 111 167 250 901Magnesium ppm 34 38 36 73Zinc ppm 62 90 138 354Phosphorus ppm 1010 942 1003 914Barium ppm <1 <1 0 4Boron ppm 155 166 132 112

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05885929 (Generated: 07/02/2023 12:05:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250E 310275\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP408949] 23 Jun 2023 @ 7550.0 hrs

